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Do you wish you could do more to help people in your community during these
lockdowns? Are you feeling frustrated because of social distancing that makes
it so hard to minister to others? Maybe the Care for Hope initiative is
something your church could get involved in. Our goal is to reach over 200,000
homes across Canada by offering them a free book called The Power of

Hope. The purpose is to target local communities - offering a tool to help
individuals deal with depression, anxiety, forgiveness and addiction, while
providing them hope. Find out more at glowcanada.ca/care. But hurry, the

deadline to register is only a couple weeks away! (For those in Quebec,
please click here: glowcanada.ca/richesse)

What is God Doing During

Lockdowns?

We, at Lifestyle Canada, are grateful for God’s guidance and protection during
this past year. Although the pandemic temporarily halted close personal
contact, the spread of GLOW tracts and other forms of literature is still having
a great impact – especially in the lives of those who are seeking answers
during this time. God is not under lockdown and His promise is still true when
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He says, “For as the rain comes down, and the snow from heaven, and do not
return there, but water the earth and make it bring forth and bud, that it may
give seed to the sower and bread to the eater, so shall My word be that goes
forth from My mouth; It shall not return to Me void, but it shall accomplish what
I please, and it shall prosper in the thing for which I sent it.” – Isaiah 55:11

The word of God is still going out through books, tracts and even virtual
contacts. Just in the last few weeks, we received requests from quite a few
people. To name a few:

• Ravi, a Hindu – for Bible studies and a copy of The Great Controversy

• Linda – just went out and recently bought a Bible. She now wants to
understand it – especially the book of Revelation! She wants to get to know
God and desires Bible studies.

• George & Davis – for more literature to get to know God through The Desire
of Ages

• Vilma, Cortney, Paul, Wendy, Anne-Marie – for Bible studies and for more
literature

• A psychiatrist in Toronto, and a university professor in Halifax – for Bible
studies & The Great Controversy

• A Presbyterian church to provide literature for their packages for the
homeless in their city

• Raylene for Bible Studies and to know more about the Seventh-day Adventist
religion, so that she can become a better person and make her life right with
Christ.

• Sandra asked for special prayer, and others requested specific prayer for
their mental health.

These are just samples of the messages we get from GLOW tracts distributed
all across Canada by people just like yourself. At Lifestyle Canada, we can
attest to the fact that, "The publications sent forth from our printing houses are
to prepare a people to meet God. Throughout the world they are to do the
same work that was done by John the Baptist for the Jewish nation." - CM 3

John the Baptist preceded Jesus. Literature is one means of planting seeds,
and precedes, in many cases, Christ's method of mingling with people. During
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lockdowns, won’t you partner with us in sharing even more of God’s word in
preparation for Christ’s return? Please pray for the Care for Hope initiative and
see if this is something your church, or a group of friends, could get involved
in.

Cancer, Diabetes & the Gospel

Did you know that 1 in 2 Canadians will develop cancer in their lifetime and
that 1 in 4 will die from it?* Cancer and diabetes are affecting so many people
and we believe there is much that can be done to help. We are so excited
about the new care packages that were developed this past year to assist with
this different kind of pandemic. To find out more, click on the picture below.

*CMAJ 2020 March 2;192:E199-205. doi: 10.1503cmaj.191292

New Resources! New Online Store!

http://www.ihealcare.org/
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Discover new products to share your faith at GLOWCANADA.CA/STORE

Please pray for us this year as we seek to reach 200,000 Canadian homes for
Christ through literature. We are confident that the sowing will one day bear
fruit, for the promise is that "More than one thousand will soon be converted in
one day, most of whom will trace their first convictions to the reading of our
publications.” - R&H Nov. 10, 1885

To make a tax-deductive contribution to this ministry, please click HERE. Your
donations and prayers make a big difference. There are so many people to
reach and Jesus’ coming is near. Thank you for giving individuals an
opportunity to know Christ - especially those who are not part of your church
members’ circle of influence.

In His service,

Jonathan Zita • Director

http://glowcanada.ca/store
http://glowcanada.ca/STORE
http://www.lifestylecanada.org/donate
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